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Dimensions : 8 x 0.13 x 10 inches

Alexander Hamilton, a West Indian-born immigrant who rose to become a
prominent figure in the American Revolution and one of the founding
fathers of the United States, played a crucial role in shaping the nation's
financial and economic systems.

Born on the Caribbean island of Nevis in 1755 to a Scottish father and a
French mother, Hamilton was orphaned at an early age. He was raised by
his relatives on the island of St. Croix, where he received a classical
education. In 1772, he was sent to New York City to continue his studies,
where he quickly became involved in the growing political unrest
surrounding the American Revolution.

Hamilton joined the Continental Army in 1776 and quickly rose through the
ranks, becoming one of George Washington's most trusted aides-de-camp.
He served with distinction in several major battles, including the Battles of
Saratoga and Yorktown. After the war, he was appointed as the first
Secretary of the Treasury by President Washington.

As Secretary of the Treasury, Hamilton played a leading role in establishing
the nation's financial and economic systems. He created the Bank of the
United States, which provided a stable currency and a central banking
system for the new nation. He also established a system of tariffs and taxes
that helped to pay off the national debt and promote domestic industry.
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Hamilton's economic policies were controversial at the time, but they
ultimately helped to lay the foundation for the nation's economic growth and
prosperity. He was a strong advocate for a strong central government and
believed that a sound financial system was essential for the nation's
success.

Hamilton was also a leading figure in the Federalist Party, which supported
the ratification of the Constitution. He wrote many of the Federalist Papers,
which were a series of essays that helped to persuade the public to support
the new Constitution. Hamilton's vision of a strong central government and
a sound financial system helped to shape the United States into the nation
it is today.

Hamilton was killed in a duel with Aaron Burr in 1804. He was only 49 years
old. Despite his short life, he left an enduring legacy as one of the most
important figures in American history.

Henry Cabot Lodge, a prominent historian and politician, wrote a biography
of Alexander Hamilton in 1882. Lodge's biography was one of the first
major works on Hamilton and remains an important source of information
about his life and career.

Lodge's biography of Hamilton begins with a detailed account of Hamilton's
early life and education. Lodge then describes Hamilton's military career
and his service as Secretary of the Treasury. Lodge also discusses
Hamilton's role in the Federalist Party and his contributions to the
Constitutional Convention.

Lodge's biography of Hamilton is a valuable resource for anyone who
wants to learn more about this important figure in American history. Lodge's



writing is clear and engaging, and he provides a comprehensive overview
of Hamilton's life and career.

Alexander Hamilton was a brilliant and ambitious man who played a pivotal
role in the American Revolution and the founding of the United States. His
economic policies helped to lay the foundation for the nation's economic
growth and prosperity. His vision of a strong central government and a
sound financial system helped to shape the United States into the nation it
is today.
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